
Terms of Service 

By accessing and using this website ("Site"), you acknowledge that you have read, 
understood, and agree to comply with the following Terms of Service ("Terms") and our 
Privacy Policy. Please read these Terms carefully before proceeding to use our Site. 

1. Acceptance of Terms 

By accessing or using our Site, you agree to be bound by these Terms, which constitute a 
legally binding agreement between you and Virtual Protocol ("we," "us," "our"). If you do not 
agree with these Terms, please refrain from using the Site. 

2. Site Content and Company Narrative 

Our Site provides information and content related to the company narrative, including but not 
limited to text, images, graphics, videos, and other materials (collectively, "Content"). The 
Content on this Site is for informational purposes only and may be subject to change without 
notice. While we strive to provide accurate and up-to-date information, we do not warrant the 
completeness, accuracy, or reliability of the Content. 

3. Intellectual Property 

All Content on this Site is protected by intellectual property laws, including but not limited to 
copyrights, trademarks, and trade secrets. You acknowledge and agree that all intellectual 
property rights related to the Site and its Content are and will remain the sole property of 
[Company Name] or its licensors. 

You may use the Content solely for personal, non-commercial purposes. Any unauthorized 
use, reproduction, distribution, or modification of the Content is strictly prohibited and may 
result in legal action. 

4. User Contributions 

We may offer features that allow users to contribute content, such as comments, feedback, 
or testimonials ("User Contributions"). By submitting User Contributions, you grant us a 
non-exclusive, perpetual, irrevocable, royalty-free, worldwide license to use, reproduce, 
modify, distribute, and display the User Contributions in connection with the Site and our 
business operations. 

You are solely responsible for your User Contributions, and they must comply with applicable 
laws and not violate the rights of any third party. We reserve the right to remove, edit, or 
refuse to post any User Contributions at our sole discretion. 

5. Third-Party Links and Content 



Our Site may contain links to third-party websites and resources. We do not endorse, 
control, or monitor the content, accuracy, or practices of these third-party sites. Your 
interactions with third-party websites are solely at your own risk, and you should review their 
respective terms of service and privacy policies. 

6. Disclaimer of Warranties 

YOUR USE OF THE SITE AND ITS CONTENT IS AT YOUR OWN RISK. THE SITE IS 
PROVIDED ON AN "AS IS" AND "AS AVAILABLE" BASIS. WE MAKE NO WARRANTIES, 
EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, REGARDING THE SITE, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO 
WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE, OR 
NON-INFRINGEMENT. 

7. Limitation of Liability 

TO THE MAXIMUM EXTENT PERMITTED BY APPLICABLE LAW, WE SHALL NOT BE 
LIABLE FOR ANY INDIRECT, INCIDENTAL, SPECIAL, CONSEQUENTIAL, OR 
EXEMPLARY DAMAGES ARISING OUT OF OR IN CONNECTION WITH YOUR USE OF 
THE SITE, EVEN IF WE HAVE BEEN ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH 
DAMAGES. 

8. Modifications to the Terms 

We reserve the right to update or modify these Terms at any time without prior notice. Any 
changes will be effective immediately upon posting the updated Terms on this Site. Your 
continued use of the Site after the changes will constitute your acceptance of the revised 
Terms. 

9. Governing Law and Jurisdiction 

These Terms shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of United 
States. Any disputes arising under these Terms shall be subject to the exclusive jurisdiction 
of the courts located in United States. 

10. Contact Us 

If you have any questions or concerns about these Terms or our Site, please contact us at 
hello@virtuals.io

mailto:hello@pathdao.io
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